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Region Recipient 

New York 

 

 

 

 

 

Crossroads Community Services – An inclusive community in Midtown 
Manhattan that provides warm meals, healthy groceries, and safe shelter 
for New Yorkers. 

 

Heart Share St. Vincent's Services – Empowers children, individuals and 
families to overcome the challenges of family crises, addiction, mental 
illness, and poverty. 

 

Monday Night Hospitality – A food pantry that provides meals to those 
most in need, as well a social services and monthly health screening 
opportunities.  

Dallas 

 

 

 

 

North Texas Food Bank – Finding unique solutions to the ongoing pursuit 
of closing the hunger gap in North Texas. 

 

Hope Supply Co. – Meeting the critical needs of homeless children by 
providing childcare necessities and toys to enhance their lives. 

 

Crossroads Community Services – A food pantry that works with 
surrounding Dallas communities by building long-term relationships with 
clients and community partners to alleviate food insecurity. 

Boston 

 
 
 

 
 

 

Bridge Over Troubled Waters – Provides effective and innovative 
services to runaways, homeless and high-risk youth, enabling youth to 
transform and build fulfilling, meaningful futures. 

 

Friends of Boston’s Homeless – Supports innovative, solutions-oriented 
programs to end homelessness. 

 

Rosie’s Place – Operates as a community center providing wide-ranging 
support, education, and outreach services to over 12,000 women a year.  

https://www.crossroadsnyc.org/
https://hsvsnyc.org/
https://www.mondaynighthospitality.org/
https://ntfb.org/
https://hopesupplyco.org/
https://ccsdallas.org/aboutcrossroads
https://bridgeotw.org/
https://fobh.org/
https://www.rosiesplace.org/


Columbus 

 

 

 

 

 

Columbus Early Learning Centers – Helping young learners develop, 
families succeed, and neighborhoods thrive. 

 

Community Shelter Board – Leading the effort to combat homelessness, 
including supporting homelessness prevention, shelter, street outreach, 
rapid re-housing, and permanent supportive housing. 

 

Mid-Ohio Food Collective – The largest food bank in Ohio, giving 
customers access to a no-cost, grocery store experience that provides 
convenient access to nutritious food. 

Chicago 

 

 

 

 

Bernie's Book Bank – The leading provider of quality books to under-
served children in the Greater Chicago area.  

 

Chicago Youth Centers – Ensuring that children have a safe place to 
explore, to discover, to process, and ultimately to envision and create a 
bright future for themselves. 

 

Sarah's Circle – Provides a full continuum of services for women, 
including housing, life necessities, and supportive services, to help them 
permanently end their homelessness. 

National 

 

Ronald McDonald House Charities – Programs that directly improve the 
health and well-being of children and their families across the U.S. 

 

 

 

http://www.columbusearlylearning.org/
https://www.csb.org/
https://mofc.org/
https://www.berniesbookbank.org/
https://www.chicagoyouthcenters.org/
https://sarahs-circle.org/
https://rmhc.org/

